IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
Wednesday, February 8, 2023 @ 1:00 pm
2023 Gravel Resurfacing of roads in lonia County

Tabulation

Bid Proposal A - Load, Haul and Place from Superior Asphalt pit

BIDDER: Carrick Trucking L & D Carey CL Trucking
Location Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source
Boston/Hastings No bid Superior $8.26 | Superior $10.98 | Superior
Campbell/Hastings No hid Superior $9.42 Superior $10.98 | Superior
Campbell/Jackson No bid Superior $8.26 | Superior $10.98 | Superior
Danby/Musgrove No bid Superior $5.14 Superior $6.98 | Superior
Danby/Tupper Lk No bid Superior $6.28 | Superior $7.48 | Superior
Odessa/Clarksville No bid Superior $6.18 Superior $7.48 | Superior
Orange/Portland No bid Superior $5.24 | Superior $7.48 | Superior
Bid Proposal B - Furnish, Load, Haul and Place 23A

BIDDER: Carrick Trucking L & D Carey CL Trucking
TOWNSHIP Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source
Berlin $12.90| Schafer Pit $15.51 | Shroefe Pit No bid

Boston $14.35| Schafer Pit $17.31 | Shroefe Pit No bid

Campbell $16.10| Schafer Pit $18.52 | Shroefe Pit No bid

Danby $13.25| Schafer Pit $17.41 | Shroefe Pit No bid

Easton $13.84| Schafer Pit $16.21 | Shroefe Pit No bid

lonia $12.22| Schafer Pit $15.07 | Shroefe Pit No bid

Keene $15.02| Schafer Pit $17.51 | Shroefe Pit No bid

Lyons $11.65| Schafer Pit $14.09 | Shroefe Pit No bid

N. Plains $12.86| Schafer Pit $15.13 | Shroefe Pit No bid

Odessa $13.78 | Schafer Pit $17.11 | Shroefe Pit No bid

Orange $12.25| Schafer Pit $14.45 | Shroefe Pit No bid

Orleans $15.48 | Schafer Pit $17.89 | Shroefe Pit No bid

Otisco $15.51| Schafer Pit $19.89 | Shroefe Pit No bid

Portland $11.95| Schafer Pit $13.63 | Shroefe Pit No bid

Ronald $13.20| Schafer Pit $15.61 | Shroefe Pit No bid

Sebewa $13.65| Schafer Pit $15.51 | Shroefe Pit No bid

02/14/23 board action:

Motion by Terry Frewen and support by Jack Shattuck to award Bid Proposal A to L&D Carey & Sons Trucking and award Bid Proposal B to Carrick

Trucking & Gravel per their respective unit prices as shown above. Motion approved.




