CONTRACT # 25-11: DUST CONTROL

JANUARY 17, 2025 @ 11:00 A.M.

TABULATION
Specific % % % NW Quadrant NE Quadrant SW Quadrant SE Quadrant |[MDOT shoulders|
Bidder Name Percent Type Gravity [Calcium{Magnesium{Sodium| Price per gal. Price per gal. Price per gal. Price per gal. Price per gal. Terms

SM Liquid Tire Fill 38% N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Net 30.

26% Mineral well brine 1.25 16.61% 3.33% 2.54% $0.190 $0.192 $0.179 $0.180 NO BID 8000 Gal min. load continus spread.
Corrigan Environmental | 38% N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Net 30
Solutions 26% Dustmaster 20 1.25 20.89% 6.37% 6.11% NO BID NO BID $0.195 $0.195 NO BID
Michigan Chloride Sales| 38% N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Net 30.

26% | Mineral Well brine|  28-30 19-20% 3-4% 4-5.5% NO BID $0.1925 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Board Action 1/28/2025: Award to lowest bidder
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