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2019 SEASONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR MATERIALS
Effective March 1, 2019 through February 29, 2020

On March 20, 2019, at the regular meeting of the Board of Road Commissioners for lonia County,
regarding 2019 Seasonal Requirements for Materials, the Board authorized management to purchase
from the lowest responsive bidders, as recommended, in the best interest of the Road Commission for
the following items:

PLASTIC PIPE
Lowest responsive bidder, as needed.

BLADES
St. Regis Culvert

SIGNS
Lowest responsive bidder, as needed.

BITUMINOUS MIX
Lakeland Asphalt

STEEL BEAM GUARDRAIL & STEEL POSTS
Lowest responsive bidder, as needed.

www.ioniacountyroads.org



IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

SEASONAL BIDS - TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 2019 @ 1:00 PM

TABULATION
PLASTIC PIPE
VanderVelde Sales & Service Inc. Etna Supply Company Advanced Drainage Systems Inc.
Weidman, Ml Grand Rapids, Ml Grand Rapids, Ml
M292 Type S Smooth Int. *Sing_jle Wall Corr. M292 Type S Smooth Int. Sing_jle Wall Corr. M292 Type S Smooth Int. Sing_jle Wall Corr.
DIAMETER | PRICE PER | DIAMETER |PRICE PER| DIAMETER | PRICE PER | DIAMETER [PRICE PER| DIAMETER | PRICE PER | DIAMETER |PRICE PER
INCHES FOOT INCHES FOOT INCHES FOOT INCHES FOOT INCHES FOOT INCHES FOOT*
4 $0.79 4 $0.40 4 $0.90 4 $0.43 4 $0.90 4 $0.43
6 $1.61 6 $0.90 6 $1.84 6 $0.95 6 $1.84 6 $0.95
8 $2.52 8 $1.60 8 $3.00 8 $1.67 8 $3.00 8 $1.67
10 $3.60 10 $3.50 10 $4.05 10 $4.47 10 $4.05 10 $4.47
12 $4.33 12 $4.00 12 $4.74 12 $5.26 12 $4.74 12 $5.26
15 $5.76 15 $5.00 15 $6.58 15[ No bid 15 $6.58 15[ No bid
18 $8.43 18 $8.00 18 $8.69 18| No bid 18 $8.69 18/ No bid
24 $13.60 24 $12.50 24 $13.69 24| No bid 24 $13.69 24| No bid
30 $19.99 30] No bid 30 $20.00 30| No bid 30 $20.00 30| No bid
36 $25.17 36|/ No bid 36 $25.26 36|/ No bid 36 $25.26 36|/ No bid
42 $36.11 42 No bid 42 $40.00 42 No bid 42 $40.00 42 No bid
48 $43.53 48[ No bid 48 $44.25 48[ No bid 48 $44.25 48[ No bid
60 No bid 60| No bid 60 $71.60 60| No bid 60 $71.60 60| No bid
Terms / Comments: Terms / Comments: Terms / Comments: *No sock

MDOT approved




IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

SEASONAL BIDS - TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 2019 @ 1:00 PM

TABULATION
BLADES
Single bevel curved Winter Equipment St. Regis Culvert Wear Parts & Equipment
Priced per 40,000 # truckload Willoughby, OH Charlotte, M Aurora, CO
6'x8"x3/4" Price Per Blade Price Per Blade Price Per Blade
5/8" hole $99.74 $96.00 $131.47
Delivery time 35 days 56 days ARO 45 days
7'x8"x3/4" Price Per Blade Price Per Blade Price Per Blade
5/8" hole $116.36 $112.00 $153.30
Delivery time 35 days 56 days ARO 45 days
7'x8"x3/4" Price Per Blade Price Per Blade Price Per Blade
3/4" hole $116.36 $116.20 $153.30
Delivery time 35 days 56 days ARO 45 days

Terms / Comments:

FOB lonia, MI. No freight
for truckload orders. Pricing
only valid for truckload
orders.

Prices are firm for 60 days
from bid date. Blades

are Vallite (thru-hardened)
not Flame Hardened.

Pricing is per 45,000 # full
truckload. Bid pricing is
guaranteed until 4/21/19.
Blades are manufactured

to order-lead time is 6 weeks
Bid is for surface hardened
single bevel blades made

by Bucyrus Blades.




SEASONAL BIDS - TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 2019 @ 1:00 PM TABULATION lonia County Road Commission
Dornbos Sign Inc. Michigan St Indust Osburn Associates
SIGNS DESCRIPTION Charlotte, Ml Lansing, Ml Logan, OH
36" STOP HIP New $40.15 No bid $52.92
HIP Refurb $32.40 $25.20 No bid
Aluminum Blank $26.59 $14.31 $28.35
36" STOP AHEAD HIP New $46.52 No bid $52.92
HIP Refurb $36.52 $25.20 No bid
Aluminum Blank $29.16 $14.31 $28.35
36" YIELD HIP New $21.33 No bid $41.16
HIP Refurb $16.20 $25.20 No bid
Aluminum Blank $14.55 $14.31 $22.05
30" STOP HIP New $28.48 No bid $36.75
HIP Refurb $22.50 $17.50 No bid
Aluminum Blank $19.02 $9.95 $19.69
30" STOP AHEAD HIP New $32.36 No bid $36.75
HIP Refurb $25.43 $17.50 No bid
Aluminum Blank $20.25 $9.95 $19.69
30X30 WARNING HIP New $29.69 No bid $36.75
HIP Refurb $22.50 $17.50 No bid
Aluminum Blank $20.25 $9.95 $19.69
36X36 WARNING HIP New $42.75 No bid $52.92
HIP Refurb $32.40 $25.20 No bid
Aluminum Blank $29.16 $14.31 $28.35
18X18 WARNING HIP New $10.69 No bid $13.23
HIP Refurb $8.10 $6.30 No bid
Aluminum Blank $7.29 $3.58 $7.09
24X18 WARNING HIP New $14.25 No bid $17.64
HIP Refurb $10.80 $8.40 No bid
Aluminum Blank $9.72 $4.77 $9.45
24X24 WARNING HIP New $19.00 No bid $23.52
HIP Refurb $14.40 $11.20 No bid
Aluminum Blank $12.96 $6.36 $12.60
48X24 WARNING HIP New $38.00 No bid $47.04
HIP Refurb $28.80 $22.40 No bid
Aluminum Blank $25.92 $12.72 $25.20
12X18 REGULATORY |HIP New $7.13 No bid $8.82
HIP Refurb $5.40 $4.20 No bid
Aluminum Blank $4.86 $2.39 $4.73
12X24 REGULATORY |HIP New $9.50 No bid $11.76
HIP Refurb $7.20 $5.60 No bid
Aluminum Blank $6.49 $3.18 $6.30
24X30 REGULATORY (HIP New $23.75 No bid $29.40
HIP Refurb $18.00 $14.00 No bid
Aluminum Blank $16.20 $7.95 $15.75




SIGNS DESCRIPTION Dornbos Sign Inc. Michigan St Indust Osburn Associates
30X30 REGULATORY (HIP New $29.69 No bid $36.75
HIP Refurb $22.50 $17.50 No bid
Aluminum Blank $20.25 $9.95 $19.69
30X36 REGULATORY [HIP New $35.63 No bid $44.10
HIP Refurb $27.00 $21.00 No bid
Aluminum Blank $24.31 $11.93 No bid
REFLECTIVE POST PANELS 3'X72"
Red|New $7.13 No bid No bid
Refurb $5.40 No bid No bid
Amber|New $7.13 No bid No bid
Refurb $5.40 No bid No bid
White[New $7.13 No bid No bid
Refurb $5.40 No bid No bid
REFL ROLLED GOODS 36"x50 yards
Black $549.00 No bid $544.50
Colored $615.60 No bid $544.50 one-sided
STREET SIGN EXTRUDED/FLAT PANEL HIP
New 9x18" $5.37 $6.95 $6.59
9x24" $7.13 $8.50 $8.82
9 x 30" $8.93 $9.85 $11.03
9 x 36" $10.69 $11.65 $13.23
9x42" $12.49 $13.45 $15.41
9x 48" $14.25 $15.95 $17.64
Refurbished 9x18" $4.07 No bid No bid
9x24" $5.40 No bid No bid
9 x 30" $6.77 No bid No bid
9 x 36" $8.10 No bid No bid
9x42" $9.47 No bid No bid
9x48" $10.80 No bid No bid
48X9 RR CROSS BUCKS $53.69 call for price $198.78
4x8 HIP rectangular panel (ea) $1.05 No bid No bid
7' painted steel delineator post (ea) $7.03 No bid No bid
Galvanized sign backing plate (ea) $0.65 No bid No bid
12 ga. Square tubing 3' length (ea) $13.46 No bid No bid
3# GALVANIZED SIGN POST U-CHANNEL
10" $34.13 No bid No bid
12" $40.96 No bid No bid
14" $47.78 No bid No bid
16" $54.60 No bid No bid

Terms / Comments:

Alum blanks are refurbished




IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

SEASONAL BIDS - TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 2019 @ 1:00 PN
TABULATION

BITUMINOUS MIX

PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON
BIDDER TYPE AT PLANT DELIVERED (50 TON MIN) TERMS / COMMENTS
Ajax Materials Corporation UPM cold mix $115.00 $140.00(Plant location: Brighton, Ml
Troy, Ml
BIDDER
Lakeland Asphalt Corp. BMP-7 (CP-7 equivalent) $91.00 $93.00
Springfield, Ml
BIDDER
Superior Asphalt Inc. UPM - CP7 $125.00 $135.00
Grand Rapids, Ml Winter hot mix $125.00 no bid




IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

SEASONAL BIDS - TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 2019 @ 1:00 PM

TABULATION

STEEL BEAM GUARDRAIL & POSTS

Jensen Bridge

Action Traffic Maintenance

Nationwide Constr

Sandusky, Ml Flint, Ml Richmond, Ml
STEEL BEAM GUARDRAIL Price Each Price Each Price Each

6' 3" TRANSITIONS W BEAM TO THRIE BEAM $102.23 $100.00 $135.00
12' 6" PANELS THRIE BEAM $138.80 $117.00 $160.00
12' 6" PANELS TYPE B STEEL BEAM GUARDRAIL $80.00 $77.50 $95.00
SRT BUFFERED ENDS $37.50 $44.00 $47.00
SRT Rail #1 $206.25 $215.00 $265.00
SRT Rail #2 $206.25 $215.00 $265.00
SRT (EA) $1,625.00 $1,575.00 $1,935.00
FLEAT (EA) $1,687.50 $1,600.00 $2,100.00
FLEAT #1 Rail $156.25 $195.00 $235.00
FLEAT #2 Rail $80.00 $105.00 $95.00
FLEAT HEAD (EA) $675.00 $675.00 $825.00
FLEAT CABLE KIT (EA) $81.25 $198.00 $145.00
SKT 350 (EA) $1,968.25 $1,995.00 $1,100.00
SKT HEAD (EA) $937.50 $935.00 $1,100.00

X-LITE 50 (EA) No Bid No Bid No Bid

TREATED WOOD GUARDRAIL POSTS
45" BREAKAWAY (EA) $34.75 $34.00 $35.00
6' SOLID (EA) $48.50 $44.00 $55.00
6' CRT (EA) $48.50 $46.00 $55.00
7' (EA) $51.50 $50.00 $63.00
8' (EA) No Bid $62.00 $74.00
STEEL GUARDRAIL POSTS

6' (EA) $40.63 $41.00 $55.00
7' (EA) $47.50 $48.00 $63.00
8' (EA) $57.00 $55.00 $71.00




IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

Jensen Bridge

Action Traffic Maintenance

Nationwide Constr

Sandusky, Ml Flint, Ml Richmond, Ml
12'6" TYPE B CONVEX RADIUS
10' $118.75 $122.00 $190.00
15' $118.75 $122.00 $190.00
20' $118.75 $118.00 $150.00
25' $118.75 $118.00 $150.00
30' $118.75 $118.00 $150.00
40' $118.75 $118.00 $150.00
50' $118.75 $118.00 $150.00
60' $118.75 $118.00 $150.00
80' $118.75 $118.00 $150.00
100" $118.75 $118.00 $150.00
FLEAT POSTS / KIT
Fleat-SP all steel post kit $1,500.00 $1,550.00 $950.00
Fleat Top Post 1 $81.25 $93.00 $135.00
Fleat Top Post 2 $81.25 $93.00 $135.00
Fleat Bottom Post 1 $243.75 $235.00 $320.00
Fleat Bottom Post 2 $106.25 $130.00 $135.00
OFFSET BLOCKS
6"X8"X14" center hole offset wood block $7.68 $5.50 $13.00
14" offset poly block $4.81 $9.75 $7.00

Terms / Comments:

Prices firm for 120
days.
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