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IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION 
GRAVEL BID TABULATION SUMMARY  
  AND AWARD RECOMMENDATION FOR 2010 
 

 
The Board reviewed the bid tabulation and recommendation for Contract #10-12 Gravel 
Resurfacing.  The recommendations are based on discussions with the townships and their 
preferences.  On March 12, 2010, at the regular meeting of the Board of Road Commissioners 
for Ionia County, per the attached tabulation sheets, award was made as follows: 
 
 
L & D Carey & Sons - Load, Haul and Place from Reynolds pit 
Townships: Ionia  $ 3.25 

    Odessa  $ 3.99 
    Sebewa $ 3.29 
 

Searles – Provide, Load, Haul and Place from Lyons Twp Pit 
Townships:  
  Lyons  $ 6.08 
  N. Plains $ 5.63 
   
Carrick - Load, Haul, and Place from Reynolds Pit 
Townships: Danby  $ 3.29 
  Orange  $ 2.44 
  Portland $ 2.28 
  *Sebewa $ 3.20 
 
Carrick - Provide, Load, Haul, and Place from their pits 
Townships: Berlin  $ 7.04 

Boston  $ 8.30 
Campbell $ 8.04 
Easton  $ 7.08 
Keene  $ 8.05 
Orleans $ 7.09 

  Otisco  $ 8.06 
  Ronald  $ 5.96  
 
  
*Award revised from L & D Carey / Reynolds Pit @ $3.29 

 
Any questions regarding this tabulation or award may be directed to Scott Peterson, Road 
Superintendent at 616-527-1700 x 108 or scott@ioniacountyroads.org  
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IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION TABULATION
Friday, March 5, 2010 @ 1:30 P.M.
2010 Gravel Resurfacing of roads in Ionia County

Load, Haul and Place
BIDDER:
TOWNSHIP Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source
Berlin No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $4.65 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $4.02 Reynolds $3.20 Reynolds
Boston No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $5.50 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $5.30 Reynolds $4.57 Reynolds
Campbell No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $6.50 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $5.88 Reynolds $5.39 Reynolds
Danby No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $4.75 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $3.98 Reynolds $3.40 Reynolds
Easton No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $4.60 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $4.09 Reynolds $3.52 Reynolds
Ionia No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $3.40 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $3.55 Reynolds $3.25 Reynolds
Keene No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $6.25 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $5.44 Reynolds $4.61 Reynolds
Lyons No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $3.95 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $3.11 Reynolds $2.52 Reynolds
N. Plains No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $4.95 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $4.29 Reynolds $4.04 Reynolds
Odessa No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $5.90 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $4.72 Reynolds $3.99 Reynolds
Orange No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $3.75 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $5.74 Reynolds $2.58 Reynolds
Orleans No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $6.00 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $4.88 Reynolds $4.50 Reynolds
Otisco No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $6.60 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $5.74 Reynolds $5.19 Reynolds
Portland No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $3.10 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $3.11 Reynolds $2.37 Reynolds
Ronald No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $4.75 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $4.44 Reynolds $4.07 Reynolds
Sebewa No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $4.70 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $3.99 Reynolds $3.29 Reynolds

Furnish, Load, Haul and Place
BIDDER:
TOWNSHIP Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source
Berlin $13.70 Lowell Pit $8.28 Lyons Twp $10.13 HSV No Bid No Bid $8.95 Hastings
Boston $12.75 Lowell Pit $8.48 Lyons Twp $10.93 HSV No Bid No Bid $8.44 Hastings
Campbell No Bid $9.05 Lyons Twp $10.08 HSV No Bid No Bid $8.40 Hastings
Danby No Bid $7.67 Lyons Twp $11.13 HSV No Bid No Bid $9.28 Hastings
Easton $12.85 Lowell Pit $7.31 Lyons Twp $10.32 LL No Bid No Bid $9.00 JD
Ionia No Bid $7.26 Lyons Twp $9.28 CL No Bid No Bid $8.45 JD
Keene $11.45 Whites Bridge $8.19 Lyons Twp $9.70 LL No Bid No Bid $9.30 JD
Lyons No Bid $6.08 Lyons Twp $8.98 CL No Bid No Bid $7.20 JD
N. Plains No Bid $5.63 Lyons Twp $9.28 CL No Bid No Bid $7.14 JD
Odessa No Bid $8.65 Lyons Twp $9.13 HSV No Bid No Bid $8.49 Hastings
Orange No Bid $7.73 Lyons Twp $10.53 HSV No Bid No Bid $9.21 JD
Orleans $13.65 Whites Bridge $7.39 Lyons Twp $9.23 LL No Bid No Bid $9.25 JD
Otisco $12.85 Whites Bridge $8.34 Lyons Twp $8.10 LL No Bid No Bid $9.04 High Grade
Portland No Bid $7.09 Lyons Twp $9.88 CL No Bid No Bid $8.45 JD
Ronald No Bid $6.11 Lyons Twp $9.28 CL No Bid No Bid $7.14 JD
Sebewa No Bid $8.27 Lyons Twp $9.93 HSV No Bid No Bid $8.95 Hastings

Rusche Trucking Searles Construction Yellow Rose Transport StoneCo of Michigan Fisher Transportation Co. L & D Carey Trucking

Rusche Trucking Searles Construction Yellow Rose Transport StoneCo of Michigan Fisher Transportation Co. L & D Carey Trucking



Load, Haul and Place
BIDDER:
TOWNSHIP Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source
Berlin No Bid Reynolds $5.10 Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds
Boston No Bid Reynolds $6.15 Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds
Campbell No Bid Reynolds $5.25 Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds
Danby $3.29 Reynolds $5.05 Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds
Easton No Bid Reynolds $4.98 Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds
Ionia No Bid Reynolds $4.80 Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds
Keene No Bid Reynolds $5.05 Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds
Lyons No Bid Reynolds $4.00 Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds
N. Plains No Bid Reynolds $5.10 Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds
Odessa No Bid Reynolds $6.05 Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds
Orange $2.44 Reynolds $5.00 Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds
Orleans No Bid Reynolds $5.98 Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds
Otisco No Bid Reynolds $6.52 Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds
Portland $2.28 Reynolds $5.10 Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds
Ronald No Bid Reynolds $5.05 Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds
Sebewa $3.20 Reynolds $5.95 Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds Reynolds

Furnish, Load, Haul and Place
BIDDER:
TOWNSHIP Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source
Berlin $7.04 Carrick No Bid
Boston $8.30 Carrick No Bid
Campbell $8.04 Carrick No Bid
Danby No Bid No Bid
Easton $7.08 Carrick No Bid
Ionia $7.15 Carrick No Bid
Keene $8.05 Carrick No Bid
Lyons No Bid No Bid
N. Plains $5.70 Carrick No Bid
Odessa $7.89 Carrick No Bid
Orange No Bid No Bid
Orleans $7.09 Carrick No Bid
Otisco $8.06 Carrick No Bid
Portland No Bid No Bid
Ronald $5.96 Carrick No Bid
Sebewa No Bid No Bid

Carrick Trucking Ken Coryell Trucking

Carrick Trucking Ken Coryell Trucking
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